SARATOGA COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS
SOLID WASTE/RECYCLING DIVISION
3654 GALWAY ROAD
BALLSTON SPA, NEW YORK 12020
Phone: (518) 885-2235

FACSIMILE COVER PAGE

DATE: 8/29/14
TO: Cascades Recovery U.S., Inc.
ATTENTION: Dale Dame

FAX NUMBER: 689-1056

NUMBER OF PAGES (Including this one) 1

COMMENTS:

2014 SEPTEMBER QUOTE RESULTS —F.Y.I.

MARKET ONP OMG OCC PLASTIC
CASCADES $70.00 $67.00 $ 100.00 NO BID
COUNTY WASTE $60.00 $60.00 $ 100.00 $200.00

EARTH WASTE/METALS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

PERKINS RECYLING $ 75.00 $70.00 $105.00 NO BID
WASTE MGT. $61.00 $55.00 $101.00 $285.00
FROM: Sally Sheldon, Recycling Program Assistant

FAX NUMBER:  (518) 885-8809

IF YOU DO NOT RECEIVE ALL THE PAGES, KINDLY CONTACT SENDER



SARATOGA COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS
SOLID WASTE/RECYCLING DIVISION
3654 GALWAY ROAD
BALLSTON SPA, NEW YORK 12020
Phone: (518) 885-2235

FACSIMILE COVER PAGE

DATE: 8/29/14
TO: County Waste & Recycling
ATTENTION: Jason Craft/Jacob Fuentes

FAX NUMBER: 935-9399

NUMBER OF PAGES (Including this one) 1

COMMENTS:

2014 SEPTEMBER QUOTE RESULTS —F.Y.I.

MARKET ONP OMG OCC PLASTIC
CASCADES $70.00 $67.00 $ 100.00 NO BID
COUNTY WASTE $60.00 $60.00 $ 100.00 $200.00

EARTH WASTE/METALS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

PERKINS RECYLING $ 75.00 $70.00 $105.00 NO BID
WASTE MGT. $61.00 $55.00 $101.00 $285.00
FROM: Sally Sheldon, Recycling Program Assistant

FAX NUMBER:  (518) 885-8809

IF YOU DO NOT RECEIVE ALL THE PAGES, KINDLY CONTACT SENDER



SARATOGA COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS
SOLID WASTE/RECYCLING DIVISION
3654 GALWAY ROAD
BALLSTON SPA, NEW YORK 12020
Phone: (518) 885-2235

FACSIMILE COVER PAGE

DATE: 8/29/14
TO: Earth Waste & Metals
ATTENTION: Jon Barber/Sherri *

FAX NUMBER: 747-8196

NUMBER OF PAGES (Including this one) 1

COMMENTS:

2014 SEPTEMBER QUOTE RESULTS —F.Y.I.

MARKET ONP OMG OCC PLASTIC
CASCADES $70.00 $67.00 $ 100.00 NO BID
COUNTY WASTE $60.00 $60.00 $ 100.00 $200.00

EARTH WASTE/METALS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

PERKINS RECYLING $ 75.00 $70.00 $105.00 NO BID
WASTE MGT. $61.00 $55.00 $101.00 $285.00
FROM: Sally Sheldon, Recycling Program Assistant

FAX NUMBER:  (518) 885-8809

IF YOU DO NOT RECEIVE ALL THE PAGES, KINDLY CONTACT SENDER



SARATOGA COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS
SOLID WASTE/RECYCLING DIVISION
3654 GALWAY ROAD
BALLSTON SPA, NEW YORK 12020
Phone: (518) 885-2235

FACSIMILE COVER PAGE

DATE: 8/29/14
TO: Perkins Recycling Corp.
ATTENTION: Scott Perkins

FAX NUMBER: 745-1734

NUMBER OF PAGES (Including this one) 1

COMMENTS:

2014 SEPTEMBER QUOTE RESULTS —F.Y.I.

MARKET ONP OMG OCC PLASTIC
CASCADES $70.00 $67.00 $ 100.00 NO BID
COUNTY WASTE $60.00 $60.00 $ 100.00 $200.00

EARTH WASTE/METALS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

PERKINS RECYLING $ 75.00 $70.00 $105.00 NO BID
WASTE MGT. $61.00 $55.00 $101.00 $285.00
FROM: Sally Sheldon, Recycling Program Assistant

FAX NUMBER:  (518) 885-8809

IF YOU DO NOT RECEIVE ALL THE PAGES, KINDLY CONTACT SENDER



SARATOGA COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS
SOLID WASTE/RECYCLING DIVISION
3654 GALWAY ROAD
BALLSTON SPA, NEW YORK 12020
Phone: (518) 885-2235

FACSIMILE COVER PAGE

DATE: 8/29/14
TO: Waste Management
ATTENTION: Jim Casey

FAX NUMBER: 747-2596

NUMBER OF PAGES (Including this one) 1

COMMENTS:

2014 SEPTEMBER QUOTE RESULTS —F.Y.I.

MARKET ONP OMG OCC PLASTIC
CASCADES $70.00 $67.00 $ 100.00 NO BID
COUNTY WASTE $60.00 $60.00 $ 100.00 $200.00

EARTH WASTE/METALS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

PERKINS RECYLING $ 75.00 $70.00 $105.00 NO BID
WASTE MGT. $61.00 $55.00 $101.00 $285.00
FROM: Sally Sheldon, Recycling Program Assistant

FAX NUMBER:  (518) 885-8809

IF YOU DO NOT RECEIVE ALL THE PAGES, KINDLY CONTACT SENDER



